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PARIS, September 18, 2024 – Proskauer, a leading international law firm announced
today that it advised Groupe Premium, a leader in the wealth management sector, on its
acquisition of Haenggi & Associés (“Haenggi”). Haenggi is a renowned wealth
management firm in the Grand Est region reputed for its cutting-edge expertise and
personalized customer support. The strategic operation is part of Groupe Premium’s
efforts to strengthen its Premium CGP division while consolidating its positions in a
dynamic region with strong development potential.

Haenggi has established itself as a key player in Strasbourg, Mulhouse, Metz and Reims
by supporting numerous clients in the management and optimization of their assets. The
firm has around twenty employees and manages €640 million in outstanding assets.

The integration will allow Groupe Premium to respond even better to the wealth
management and investment needs of its local clients. It will also allow Groupe Premium
to advance its national development plan, a major platform of which is strengthening the
territorial network of its Premium CGP division. The new establishment in the east of
France marks a decisive step in this strategy.

Groupe Premium is a longtime client of Proskauer’s Paris team and the Firm has advised
the company on several transactions. including its recent acquisition of Neolife. The
Proskauer team advising Groupe Premium on its acquisition of Haenggi was led by
partner Jeremy Scemama and associates Aurélie Briquet and Mohamed Kettani (M&A).
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The world’s leading organizations and global players choose Proskauer to represent them
when they need it the most. With 800+ lawyers in key financial centers around the world,
we are known for our pragmatic and commercial approach. Proskauer is the place to turn
when a matter is complex, innovative and game-changing. We work seamlessly across
practices, industries and jurisdictions with asset managers, private equity and venture
capital firms, Fortune 500 and FTSE companies, major sports leagues, entertainment
industry legends and other industry-redefining companies.

Our premier M&A practice is distinguished by the combination of our transactional
strength and deep sector knowledge. We are a destination firm for large-cap and middle-
market deals with extensive expertise in the structural, cultural and procedural issues
that are often at the center of complex, cross-border transactions. From London to New
York, Paris to Los Angeles and across the globe, organizations turn to our lawyers for
their most significant and transformative transactions. Our multi-disciplinary team offers
actionable insights, sophisticated strategies and creative solutions that drive commercial
success for our clients.
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